Registered with the Registrar
of Newspapers for India
under No. 10410

i R
®
UG &ECEM R SigdHD
La Gazette de L' Etat de Poudouchery
The Gazette of Puducherry

PART - 11
Amriy aenelui® EXTRAORDINAIRE EXTRAORDINARY

S Fmrd Qumm Publiée par Published by
Qeuafluf® Autorité Authority
B ygFGaF dwnrpsspmw 2024 @F° saraf i 18 A
No. » 3 Poudouchéry Jeudi 18 Janvier 2024
No. Puducherry Thursday 18th January 2024

(28 Pausa 1945)

GOVERNMENT OF PUDUCHERRY
LABOUR DEPARTMENT

(G.O. Ms. No. 1/AIL/Lab./G/2024,
Puducherry, dated 02nd January 2024)

NOTIFICATION

Whereas, the Draft Rules seeking to amend the Puducherry
Factories Rules, 1964, was issued in the Government of Puducherry,
Labour Department’s Notification under G.O. Ms. No. 06/AIL/Lab/G/2022,
dated 31st May 2022 and published as required under sub-section (1)
of section 115 of the Factories Act, 1948 (Central Act 63 of 1948),

[21]



22 LA GAZETTE DE L'ETAT [PAarT-II

in the Extraordinary Gazette Part -II, No. 31, dated 12th July 2022
of the Government of Puducherry, inviting objections and suggestions,
if any, from all persons likely to be affected thereby;

And whereas, no objection or suggestion has so far been received
from any quarter in this regard;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred under
section 112 of the Factories Act, 1948, the Lieutenant-Governor,
Puducherry, hereby makes the following rules further to amend the
Puducherry Factories Rules, 1964, namely :-

1. Short title and commencement.— (1) These rules may be called
the Puducherry Factories (Amendment) Rules, 2023.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication
in the Official Gazette.

2. Amendment to rule 4.— In the Puducherry Factories Rules, 1964
(hereinafter, referred to as the said rules), in rule 4, for the existing
Schedule thereunder, the following Schedule shall be substituted, namely:



nmmﬂ!-
lum;“m” imum number of tos bie emplayed o0 ary dir during the year
Maobsle Equigment: | s | 0 | som MO0 | e | s00 | 10000 | Abowe 10080
[ [FT T [ I 5l I T w | | twm | on [T
Fiis Farpable i Aupecs
Ml Hocie Power As 200 P 1,000 i 3,800 Ay 1,200 R 7,200 R 10, B0 A 24 0 R, 35, 000 R 66, (50 R B 00 As. 1, 30,000
”"“!"f'"‘""‘“ Aslb00 | ®dsco | ms3a00 | measse | Rs1osm | meinoon | Rsdpooo | mrzoon | Raafeoo | Reisenon | As)E00m
Aburew 10 Horse
Piasget Uil 500 Rs 3400 As 4,300 As 4 500 Ri T, 200 P 18,000 . TH AN Rs 73,000 R L0800 | R 144000 i 180,000 A 306,000
 Horse power
Ao 50 Harse
P upts 128 Lo P g 800 R 7 200 P 12,000 Az 18,500 A AR, KO Ao LOB 000 | Ma14a000 | Rl 8000 i T, 18,000 Re. 240,000
Li-u-m‘r
Akowe 179 Horse:
Prrser uplo 250 LEER-E] LEW A ] F5. 12,000 s 18200 Hs 4E 000 R 72,000 Rilad 000 | Ralsnong | Es.2 16000 LI E et o] Fa.1, b4, 000
Herio Fower
Aboer 150 Horge
Pasver ugho 40 R 7200 Ra.22.000 R 16 000 A 2%, 600 Fg. 73,000 LRl )] B 1,B0000 | M2 B0000 | As 240,000 2 8 Ag 3B 000
Honie Powsr
Bbave S0 HOvSE
Fower upla 1020 R 13,0040 B 13000 Rs 75,600 Boan 000 R5.56,000 By, 20,000 Rsd, 16,005 Fol 80N | Rl S8 000 R 2 0E (G RAs 3, 1380
Herus P
Aboree 1000 Hores
Positt 1 Lighe 2000 As DX 300 | Ma2% 600 Az 48000 Pyl THE) As.1, 20,000 As 141 000 Ru2A0G00 | Ra 24000 | Red8E DX Fi 113000 R 336,000
Hore Power
Aibgasr 2000 Hore
Fawir upta 5000 L 7] Rs 85,000 i £, 00 Rs BOYDOD ALl A4000 | RulEEDOG | ExZ s, 000 ReZBE 0N | Had,12,000 Rz.3.36 000 e 3, BO 0D
B r P
’T’-l;ﬂmw
Poser gt F502 As AR OO0 || As 6 000 B 5000 s 55 0 F2. 166000 | Re192000 | A 2EA000 | RE13,000 | Re 336000 As 3,650,000 LEURRLET e
| Hisiii poaer .
Bbsva 7500 Horge
Fowed uplo 10303 R fd 00 R B0, 000 A B4, D0 As.1,12000 | AsLE2000 | As216000 | Readzond | A3 8000 | Rl 0 Re 3 B4 (00 A 0E K0
Horid Fomer 5
mmm As 0000 | ExS0000 | AsLA2000 | MalIR000 | ReZi6000 | RuzA0000 | Re3 36000 | As260000 853, B4, D00 LELAI LG (] Fe. £ 31,000

[11-1avd

IVLIHdT1dd dLLHZVD V1

€C



24 LA GAZETTE DE L'ETAT [PAarT-II

3. Amendment to rule 5.— In the said rules, in sub-rule (3)
for the words “fifty rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees” shall be
substituted.

4. Amendment to rule 7.— In the said rules, in sub-rule (2)
for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”
shall be substituted.

5. Amendment to rule 9.— In the said rules, for the words
“one hundred rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees” shall be
substituted.

6. Amendment to rule 105.— In the said rules, in clause (a)
of sub-rule (2-A) for the figures and words “rupees 50 per year per worker”,
the figures and words, “rupees 200 per year per worker” shall be
substituted.

(By order of the Lieutenant-Governor)

P. RAGINI,
Under Secretary to Government (Labour).

online publication at “https://styandptg.py.gov.in”
Published by the Director, Government Press, Puducherry.



